
Contract Number CM2044 
Bid Number NC13-040 

CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

THIS CONTRACT entered into this 24th day of 2014, by and 

between the BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF NASSAU COUNTY, 

FLORIDA, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, hereinafter referred to as "County", 

and QUADMED, INC, 11210-1 Philips Industrial Boulevard, Jacksonville, FL 32256, 

hereinafter referred to as "Vendor". 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Nassau County, Florida opened 

sealed bids for Medical Supplies, Bid Number NC13-040, on September 26, 2013 at 10:00 a.m.; 

and 

WHEREAS, the Fire Rescue Department determined that QuadMed, Inc was the lowest, 

most responsive and responsible bidder for the bid items as set forth in Exhibit "A"; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the terms and conditions herein set forth, the 

County and the Vendor agree as follows: 

SECTION 1. Description of Services to be Provided 

The County does hereby retain the Vendor to furnish materials or services as further 

described in the Scope of Services attached hereto as Exhibit "B" and made a part hereof. 

Required materials and service shall be specifically enumerated, described and depicted in the 

Purchase orders authorizing performance of the specific task. This Contract standing alone does 

not authorize the performance of any work or require the County to place any orders for work. 

SECTION 2. Receiving/Payment/Invoicing 

No payment will be made for materials ordered without proper purchase order 

authorization. The County shall pay the vendor within forty-five (45) calendar days of receipt 

of invoice, pursuant to and in accordance with the promulgations set forth by the State of 

Florida's Prompt Payment Act. (Florida Statutes Section 218.70). Payment shall not be made 

until materials, goods or services have been received, inspected and accepted by the County in 

the quality and quantity ordered. Payment will be accomplished by submission of an invoice, in 

duplicate, with the Purchase Order number referenced thereon and mailed to the address set forth 

in the Purchase Order. Payment in advance of receipt of goods or services by Nassau County 

cannot be made. 
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The invoice submitted shall be in sufficient detail as to item, quantity and price in order 

for the County to verify compliance with the awarded bid. 

SECTION 3. Acceptance of Goods/Services 

Receipt of goods/services shall not constitute acceptance. Final acceptance and 

authorization of payment shall be given only after a thorough inspection indicates that the 

product/performance meets bid specifications and conditions. Should the products/services 

differ in any respect from specifications, payment will be withheld until such time as the supplier 

takes necessary corrective action. If the proposed corrective action is not acceptable to the 

County, the County Manager's Office may authorize the recipient to refuse final acceptance of 

the goods/services. Should a representative of the County agree to accept the goods/services on 

condition that the Vendor will correct his performance within a stipulated time period, then 

payment will be withheld until the services are performed as specified. 

SECTION 4. Inspection/Acceptance Title 

Inspection and acceptance will be at destination unless otherwise stipulated. Title and 

risk of loss or damage to all items shall be the responsibility of the Vendor until accepted by the 

using department of Nassau County, unless loss or damage results from negligence by Nassau 

County or it's using Department. 

SECTION 5. Firm Prices 

Prices for goods and services covered in the specifications shall be firm; net delivered to 

the ordering agency, F.O.B. DESTINATION, vendor paying all delivery costs and shall remain 

firm for the period of this Contract. No additional fees or charges shall be accepted. 

SECTION 6. Fund Availability 

This Contract is deemed effective only to the extent that appropriations are available. 

Pursuant to Florida Statutes all appropriations lapse at the end of the Fiscal Year. Multi-year 

awards shall be adequately funded but the County reserves the right not to appropriate for an 

ongoing procurement if it is deemed in its best interest. 

SECTION 7. Permits/Licenses/Fees 

Any permits, licenses or fees required for this service will be the responsibility of the 

Vend or unless otherwise stated. 
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SECTION 8. Taxes 
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The County is tax exempt. As such, the County will not pay any Federal Excise or State 

ofFlorida Sales Tax. The Vendor will refrain from including taxes in any billing. 

SECTION 9. Laws Governing this Contract 

This Contract shall be consistent with, and be governed by, the Ordinances of Nassau 

County, the whole law of the State of Florida, both procedural and substantive, and applicable 

federal statutes, rules and regulations. Any and all litigation arising under this Contract shall be 

brought in Nassau County, Florida. 

SECTION 10. Changes 

The County reserves the right to order, in writing, changes in the work within the scope 

of the contract, such as change in quantity or delivery schedule. The Vendor has the right to 

request an equitable price adjustment in cases where changes to the contract under the authority 

of this clause result in increased costs to the Vendor. 

SECTION 11. Modifications 

In addition to modifications made under the changes clause, this Contract may be 

modified within the scope of the contract upon the written and mutual consent of both parties, 

and approval by appropriate legal bodies in the County. 

SECTION 12. Assignment & Subcontracting 

The Vendor will not be permitted to assign its contract with the County, or to subcontract 

any of the work requirements to be performed without obtaining prior written approval by the 

County. 

SECTION 13. Severability 

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this Contract is, for any 

reason, held invalid, unconstitutional, or unenforceable by any Court of Competent Jurisdiction, 

such portion shall be deemed as a separate, distinct, and independent provision, and such holding 

shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions thereof. 

SECTION 14. Termination for Default 

The performance of the Contract may be terminated by the County in accordance with 

this clause, in whole or in part, in writing, whenever the County shall determine that the Vendor 

has failed to meet performance requirement( s) of the Contract. 
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SECTION 15. Termination for Convenience 
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The County reserves the right to terminate the Contract in whole or part by giving the 

vendor written notice at least thirty (30) days prior to the effective date of the termination. Upon 

receipt of termination from the County, the Vendor shall only provide those services specifically 

approved or directed by the County. All other rights and duties of the parties under the Contract 

shall continue during such notice period, and the County shall continue to be responsible to the 

vendor for the payment of any obligations to the extent such responsibility has not been excused 

by breach of default of the Vendor. 

SECTION 16. Force Majeure 

Neither party of this Contract shall be liable to the other for any cost or damages if the 

failure to perform the Contract arises out of causes beyond the control and without the fault or 

negligence of the parties. Such causes may include, but are not restricted to, acts of nature, fires, 

quarantine restriction, strikes and freight embargoes. In all cases, the failure to perform must be 

totally beyond the control and without any fault or negligence of the party. 

SECTION 17. Access and Audits 

The Vendor shall maintain adequate records to justify all charges, expenses, and costs 

incurred in performing the Work for at least three (3) years after completion of this Contract. 

The County and the Clerk of Courts shall have access to such books, records, and documents as 

required in this Section for the purpose of inspection or audit during normal business hours, at 

the County's or the clerk's cost, upon five (5) days' written notice. 

SECTION 18. Vendor Responsibilities 

The Vendor will provide the services agreed upon in a timely and professional manner in 

accordance with specifications. 

SECTION 19. Public Emergencies 

The Vendor shall agree before, during, and after a public emergency, disaster, hurricane, 

tornado, flood, or other acts of nature that the County shall require a "First Priority" for goods and 

services. It is vital and imperative that the majority of citizens are protected from any emergency 

situation that threatens public health and safety, as determined by the County. The Vendor agrees to 

rent/sell/lease all goods and services to the county or governmental entities on a "first priority" 

basis. The County expects to pay a fair and reasonable price for all products and services rendered 

or contracted in the event of a disaster, emergency, hurricane, tornado or other acts of nature. 
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SECTION 20. Period of Contract/Option to Extend or Renew 
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This Contract shall begin on the date of execution of this contract and terminate one year 

from the date of execution. The performance period of this Contract may be extended upon 

mutual Contract between the vendor and the County with no change in terms or conditions. 

Under this provision, three extensions of performance period shall be allowed in one (1) year 

increments. Total contract length and individual one (1) year extensions shall not exceed four 

(4) years in total. Any Contract or amendment to the Contract shall be subject to fund 

availability and mutual written agreement between the County and the Vend or. 

SECTION 21. Exercise of Option 

Exercise of option to extend term of contract: If the County wishes to enter into an 

option period, the County shall request from the Vend or their written statement of desire to enter 

into an extension of the performance period. 

SECTION 22. Probationary Period 

The first ninety (90) days of this Contract are to be considered a "probationary" period. 

At the County's election, this Contract may be terminated, based on the performance of the 

Vendor, and a new award be granted without another formal bid. 

SECTION 23. Escalation Clause 

Ninety (90) days prior to the end of the contract term, the Vendor may request in writing 

an increase in an individual item unit cost. Consideration of price increases at each renewal 

period will be given provided such escalations are reasonable and acceptable to the County. It is 

also expected that de-escalation of prices will be extended to the County if market so reflects. 

The County will consider a price adjustment based on the latest Consumer Price Index and/or 

proof of a manufacturer's price increase. Any and all proposed increases are subject to approval 

by the County. 

SECTION 24. Supervision 

The Vendor shall act as an independent contractor and not as an employee of the County. 

The County shall not exercise any supervision or control over the Vendor's employees 

performing services under this Contract. Such employees shall be accountable not to the County, 

but solely to the Vendor, who in tum is responsible to the County. 
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SECTION 25. Indemnification and Insurance 
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The Vendor shall indemnify and hold harmless the County and its agents and employees 

from and against all claims, damages, losses and expenses, including attorney's fees, arising out 

of or resulting from the performance of this contract, provided that any such claims, damage, loss 

or expense is attributable to bodily injury, sickness, disease or death, or to loss to or destruction 

of tangible property, including loss of use resulting therefrom; and is caused in whole or in part 

by any negligent or willful act or omission of the Vendor and/or Subcontractor, anyone directly 

or indirectly employed by any of them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable. 

In any and all claims against the County or any of its agents or employees, by any 

employee of the Vendor, any Subcontractor, anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of 

them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable, the indemnification obligation shall 

not be limited in any way by any limitation on the amount or type of damages, compensation, or 

benefits payable by or for the Vendor or any Subcontractor under Workers' Compensation acts, 

disability benefit acts, or other employee benefits act. 

The vendor shall, on a primary basis, and at its sole expense, agree to maintain in full 

force and effect at all times during the life of this contract, insurance coverage's, limits, 

including endorsements, as described herein. The requirements contained herein, as well as the 

County's review or acceptance of insurance maintained by the Vendor is not intended to and 

shall not in any manner limit or qualify the liabilities and obligations assumed by the Vendor 

under the Contract. 

Workers' Compensation: The Vendor shall agree to maintain Workers' Compensation 

Insurance and Employers Liability in accordance with Florida Statute Chapter 440. Coverage 

must include Employers Liability with a minimum limit of $100,000 for bodily injury caused by 

an accident, each accident; $100,000 for bodily injury caused by a disease, each employee; 

$500,000 for bodily injury caused by a disease, policy limit. 

Business Auto Policy: The Vendor shall agree to maintain Business Automobile Liability 

at a limit of liability not less than $1,000,000 each occurrence for all owned, non-owned and 

hired automobiles. In the event the Vendor does not own any automobiles, the Business Auto 

Liability requirement shall be amended allowing the Vendor to agree to maintain only Hired and 

Non-Owned Auto Liability. This amended requirement may be satisfied by way of endorsement 

to the Commercial General Liability, or separate business auto coverage form. 

6 



Contract Number CM2044 
Bid Number NC13-040 

Commercial General Liability: Commercial General Liability for public liability during the 

lifetime of this Contract shall have minimum limits of $1,000,000 each occurrence, $2,000,000 

General Aggregate; and $2,000,000 Products-Completed Operations Aggregate. Coverage shall 

include Premises and/or Operations, Independent Contractors, Products and/or Complete 

Operations, Personal and Advertising Liability, Contractual Liability and Broad Form Property 

Damage Endorsements. Coverage shall not contain an exclusion or limitation endorsement for 

Contractual Liability or Cross Liability. Coverage for the hazards of explosion, collapse and 

underground property damage (XCU) must also be included when applicable to the work to be 

performed. All insurance policies shall be issued from a company or companies duly licensed by 

the State of Florida. All policies shall be on an occurrence basis; the County shall not accept 

claims-made policies. Specific endorsements will be requested depending upon the type and 

scope of work to be performed. 

Additional Insured Requirements: Certificates showing proof of the above required insurance 

shall be provided to the County prior to start of this contract and shall be attached hereto as 

Exhibit "C". Except as to Workers' Compensation and Employers' Liability, said Certificate(s) 

shall clearly state that coverage required by the Contract has been endorsed to include Nassau 

County, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, its officers, agents and employees as 

Additional Insured with a CG 2026-Designated Person or Organization endorsement, or similar 

endorsement, to its Commercial General Liability. The name for the Additional Insured 

endorsement issued by the insurer shall read "Nassau County, a political subdivision of the State 

of Florida, its officers, employees and agents". Above stated insurance policies will be endorsed 

to unequivocally provide thirty (30) days written notice to the County prior to any adverse 

changes, cancellation, or non-renewal of coverage thereunder. A copy of the policy 

endorsements must be included with the Certificate of Insurance. Said liability insurance must 

be acceptable by and approved by the County as to form and types of coverage. In the event that 

the statutory liability of the County is amended during the term of this Contract to exceed the 

above limits, the contractor shall be required, upon thirty (30) days written notice by the County, 

to provide coverage at least equal to the amended statutory limit ofliability ofthe County. 

SECTION 26. Disputes 

Any dispute arising under this Contract shall be addressed by the representatives 

of the County and the Consultant as set forth herein. Disputes shall be set forth in writing to the 
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County Manager with a copy to the Department Head or Consultant, depending on which party 

initiates the dispute, and provided by overnight mail, UPS, FedEx, or certified mail. A response 

shall be provided in the same manner prior to the initial meeting with the County Manager, the 

Department Head (or their designee), and a representative of the Consultant. This initial meeting 

shall take place no more than thirty (30) days from the written notification of the dispute 

addressed to the County Manager. 

If the dispute is not settled at the initial meeting, the County Manager shall immediately 

notify the County Attorney. The Department Head (or his/her designee), the County Attorney, 

the County Manager, and the Department Head (or their designee(s)) shall meet with the 

Consultant's representative(s) within thirty (30) days ofthe County Manager's notification to the 

County Attorney of the continued dispute. 

If there is no satisfactory resolution, the claims, disputes, or other matters in question 

between the parties to this Agreement arising out of or relating to this Agreement or breach 

thereof, shall be submitted to mediation in accordance with mediation rules as established by the 

Florida Supreme Court. Mediators shall be chosen by the County and the cost of mediation shall 

be borne by the Consultant. If either party initiates a Court proceeding, and the Court orders, or 

the parties agree to, mediation, the cost of mediation shall be borne by the Consultant. 

Consultant shall not stop work during the pendency of mediation or dispute resolution. No 

litigation shall be initiated unless and until the procedures set forth herein are followed. 

SECTION 27. Entire Agreement 

The written terms and provisions of this contract shall supersede all pnor verbal 

statements of any official or other representative of the County. Such statements shall not be 

effective or be construed as entering into, or forming a part of, or altering in any manner 

whatsoever, this Contract or contract documents. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this contract on this day and year 

first above written. 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
NASSAU COU DA 

Its: Chair 

Attest as to authenticity of the 
Chair's signature: 

Approved as to form and legality by the 
Nassau Cou ty 
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STATE OF _(-=-L-:---r-....-­
COUNTY OF --=lJ...::..:U:....;;.()..:....:.;4_;:;_L __ 

Contract Number CM2044 
Bid Number NC13-040 

QUADMED, INC 

111~--By: Marley Pnce 
Its: Vice President 

Before me personally appeared, }!1AR Lf Y (J /(_/ Ct , who is personally 
known __ or produced as identification, known to be the 
person described in and who executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged to and before 
me that he/she executed said instrument for the purposes therein expressed. 

z::t;;;i)~tialseal, thisl~dayof__Ebliv~Ol4. 

Notary Signature 

Notary-Public-State of 
My Commission expires: 

,_ ... 
= -· .... ~ 
fTl 

("l 

(.r; 

t" 
n ' 

.{1~ at large 

v/'+IJI 
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ERIN GARDNER 
MY COMMISSION #FF023852 

EXPIRES June 4. 201 7 

FloridaNotaryService.com 



EXHIBIT ''A'' 

MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID 
NO: NC13-040 

AWARD SPREADSHEET 



EXHIBIT "A" 

Bid Tabulation for A ward Summary 
NC13-040 Medical Supplies 
Revised November 20, 2013 

GROUPING RECOMMENDED VENDOR 
Airway Kentron Health Care 
Airway Equipment Boundtree Medical 
Airway, King System Q~:~aElmeEl Boundtree Medical 
Airway Laryngoscope Southeastern Emergency Equipment 
Bandages Southeastern Emergency Equipment 
Bio-Waste Boundtree Medical 
Disposable Linen Boundtree Medical 
Fluids Boundtree Medical 
Immobilization Quadmed 
Instruments Kentron Health Care 
IV Supplies Boundtree Medical 
Monitoring Henry Schein 
Monitoring Equipment Boundtree Medical 
Monitoring Glucose Southeastern Emergency Equipment 
Monitoring Lifepak 12/15 Henry Schein 
Needles Henry Schein 
Oxygen Delivery Boundtree Medical 
Oxygen Equipment Kentron Health Care 
Pharmaceuticals Henry Schein 
PPE Quadmed 
Suction Henry Schein 
Syringes Henry Schein 
Twinpak No longer used- no award 



Bid Number NC13-040 
Medical Supplies 

Contract Management 
Prepared by Dawn Krass 

Bid Tabulation (Revised November 20, 2013) 

Page 1 ol12 

----------~-----------------~ 

Bids Opened 9126113 

Revised 11120/13 

a 
H 
b:l 
H 
1-3 

I 

> 
I 
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Bids Opened 9/26/13 

Revised 11/20/13 

a 
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I 
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I 
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Bid Number NC13..Q40 
Medical Supplies 

Bid Tabulation (Revised November 20, 2013) Bids Opened 9/26/13 

lestrant. Wrist Disposable I I 12 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! IPAIR I $3.101 1 I$ 3.1000 I$ 37.2000 I PAIR I $4.67J 2 I$ 2.3350 I$ 28.0200 IPAIR I $2.981 
iAM Splint I Flex-All I I 60 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! lEACH I $4.901 1 I $ 4.9000 I $ 294.0000 lEACH I $3.98J 1 I $ 3.9800 I $ 238.8000 lEACH I $2.35! 
iAM Pelvic Sling I Medium I 10 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE I lEACH I $65.181 1 I$ 65.1800 I$ 651.8000 I JNO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! I INO BIC 
iAM Pelvic Sling I Large I 10 I INO BID I I #VALUE' I #VALUE I lEACH I $67.181 1 I$ 67.1800 I$ 671.8000 I JNO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! I JNO BIC 

I Loop Ends, Push Button 
itretcher Strap T Buckle I 28 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! lEACH I $6.551 1 I$ 6.5500 I$ 183.4000 lEACH I $6.321 1 I$ 6.3200 I$ 176.9600 lEACH I $6.5! 
·raction Splint IOD-3 Child I 1 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! lEACH I $157.691 1 I$ 157.6900 I$ 157.6900 lEACH I $139.771 1 I$ 139.7700 I$ 139.7700 lEACH I $139.: 
·raction S lint QD-4 Adult 1 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $157.69 1 $ 157.6900 $ 157.6900 EACH $139.77 1 $ 139.7700 $ 139.7700 EACH $139.;, 

~""" ')enter Punch ""' • ..~ ...... 011"'\ .U\IAI .. ~. .U\IAI llet ~~~. .... u ,..,. .... ~ ... "'............. "' ........ "'"'"'" eAr-LJ ......... " ... n.. ........ ... "'"' "'"'"" eA,-.u ,..,. .... 

=creeps, Magill I Pediatric 
=creeps, Magill I Adult 
=orceps, Kelly 1rved 
=orceps, Kelly "Straight 
~ing Cutter 
~ing Cutter Blades 
icalpel. disposable. #1 
)hears, Trauma EACH 
frousseau Dilator $1 U£t • .,)u 

10 Dro IV Admin Set P/N EMS3110 •• ·~ 
)rop IV Admin Set P/N EMS3160 

1-Way Stopcock JP/N 2C6240 I 300 I JNO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! ICASE I $64.501 50 I $ 1.2900 I $ 387.0000 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #V. INC 
'rep Pads I Medium I 2000 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! IBOX I $1.501 200 I$ 0.00751$ 15.0000 IBOX I $0.821 100 I$ 0.00821 $ 16.4000 I BOX .27 20 

trol Set, 60 Drops I PIN 2CBB19 I 50 I INO BID I I #VALUE I I #VALUE I ICASE I $230.001 20 I$ 11.5000 I$ 575.0000 I INO BID I I #VALUE I I #VI INC 
IExtensionSet JP/NAE-3108 I 5000 I INOBID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! ICASE I $164.001 100 I$ 1.64001$ 8.200.0000IEACH I $1.461 1 I$ 1.46001$ 7.300.0000IEACH 
I Site Dressing I Pediatric I 500 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! IBOX I $45.921 100 I$ 0.4592 I$ 229.6000 IBOX I $34.441 100 I$ 0.3444 I$ 172.2000 IBOX $358.22 
I Site Dressing !Adult I 1000 I INO BID I I #VALUE' I #VALUE I IBOX I $42.681 100 I$ 0.4268 I$ 426.8000 IBOX I $36.671 100 I$ 0.3667J $ 366.7000 IBOX 
everLockCannula IP/NNF9200 I 300 I INOBID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! I INOBID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! ICASE I $26.621 100 J$ 0.2662J$ 79.8500ICASE I $110.90 
~icro-Voi.ExtensionSet IP/N2N3348 I 250 I INOBID I I #VALUE' I #VALUE! ICASE I $82.001 50 I$ 1.64001$ 410.00001 INOBID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! ICASE I $69.51 
~organ Lens I I 25 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! lEACH I $20.281 1 I $ 20.2800 I $ 507.0000 lEACH I $22. 
'ressure Infuser. Disposable l1000ml I 20 I INO BID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! lEACH I I 1 I$ I$ lEACH I $13.031 1 I$ 13.0300 I$ 260.6000 lEACH I $8. 
1urniauet,LatexFree l1"X18" I 6000 I INOBID I I #VALUE! I #VALUE! ICASE I $11.301 100 I$ 0.11301$ 678.0000IPACK I $0.861 10 I$ 0.08601$ 516.0000IPACK I $16.501 250 

lood Press. ISPQSB 

iood Press. ISPQSB 

lood Press. ISDOSB 

lood Press. ISDOS< 

lood Press. lanual 
lood Press. lanual 

llood Press. fManual 
llood Press. t Manual 
:02 Detector 
:02 Detector 

Defibrillation Pad 
J156 I Defibrillation Pad 
J157 I EKG Electrodes 

1158 IEKG Electrodes 
J159 llifePak 12/15 Pulse Ox Sensor 
J160 JlilePak 12/15 Pulse Ox Sensor 
J161 JlilePak 12/15 Pulse Ox Sensor 
J162 JlilePak 12/15 Pulse Ox Sensor 
J163 JlifePak 15 Temp Sensor 

J164 I Nail Polish Remover Pads 
J165 I Razors, Disposable 

Contract Management 
Prepared by Dawn Krass 

PiN 2N3395 240 

Infant, ML Fitting "" 
:hild. ML Fitting 
imall Adult, ML Fitting 

Mutt, ML Fitting 
Large Adult, ML Fitting 
Infant lEACH .34 I$ I$ JEACH 
Child lEACH .34 I$ I$ .u800 J $ 127.60 JEACH $5.79 

I Adult lEACH .34 I$ I $ 160.2000 lEACH 5.54 5.5400 I $ 166.20 JEACH $5.79 
Laroe Adult lEACH I$ I$ 224.1000 lEACH l.03 8.0300 I $ 240.90 JEACH $5.79 

JPedi-Cap II lli<: #VA #VALUE! lEACH l.94 8.94oo 1 $ 5,364. JEACH $9.24 
jEasy Cap II lli<: #VA #VALUE! lEACH l.94 8.94oo 1 $ 7,152. JEACH $9.24 
I Pediatric, Multifunction _II\ ~ 1.95 Ll_ I$ 526.8ooo lli<: #VALUE! I #VALUE! lli<: 
JAdult, Multifunction ~ JNOBID #VALUE' #VALUE! IPAIR 18.29 I$ 18.290 I$ 438.96oo JNOBIC #VAL[J_E_!_L__IIV,I\LUE! CASE _$318.80 _l(l_ 
I Pediatric, Diaphoretic JNO BID #VALUE' #VALUE I NOBIC #VALUE' #VALUE! IBOX $9.21 _§O_l$_0.15_35[_$ _153.50 JPACK _l;0,4Z _?_ 

8000 INOBID #VALUE I #VALUE I INOBID #VALUE I #VALUE! IPACK $4.38 30 I$ 0.14§Q_l_t_j,1~.Qil90JBA(3 _$4~1:! _lQ_ 
jlnfant, 1-20 I 100 JNOBID #VALUE! #VALUE! INOBID #VALI,J_E_!_ #VALUE!_IE~(;H_ _j1~,46 L$ 19.4600 I $ 1,946.0000 lEACH $17.65 
I Pediatric, D-20 I 250 JNOBID #VALUE! #VALUE! INOBID #VALUE! #VA"UE;!__j(OA(;f:l_ _j_~91 LL 14.9400!$_3235,0000 ICASE )3~,75 _2~ 

JAdult, Reuseable I 75 JNOBID #VALUE! #VALUE! INOBID #VALUE!_ #VAL\)_El_ ~9~Q #VALUE! _I #VALUE! lEACH )120.96 
I Extension Cable, 411 I 20 JNOBID #VALUE! #VALUE I INOBID _#VAL_UE;! _IIVJILUE! i~QJliD #VALUE! I #VALUE!- lEACH $41_.12 

1996-ooo359 1 1 oo JNO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! INOBID #VALUE! #VALUE! INOBID #VALUE! I #VALUE! lEACH >138.67 

~ JNOBID #VALUE! I #VALUE! IBOX $3.471 100 I$ 0.0347 I$ 34.7000 IBOX $3.53 l!___Q,Q353 I $ 35.3000 IBOX $3.83 
_§Q_ JNO BID #VALUE! I #VALUE! IBOX $6.65J 50 I $ 0.1330 I $ 6.6500 lEACH $0.26 I $ 0.2600 I $ 13.0000 IBOX $17.00J 50 
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Bid Number NC13..Q40 
Medical Supplies 

Bid Tabulation (Revised November 20, 2013) 

f22Q'i'iirojjine --- tmg, tOml Lifeshield-- 150 NO BID IIVALUEf- #VALUE! NO BID #VALUE! I #VAl 
221 Ammonia Inhalant 10 oer Box 80 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! BOX $1.12 tO $ 
222 Aspirin, Chewable 8tma Bottle 100 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! BOTTLE $0.76 36 $ 

Atrooine Sullate tma, 10ml Lifeshield 150 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $5.45 1 $ 
Calcium Chloride tam, 10ml Lileshield 20 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE I NO BID ltV~ 

Charcoal ISOam Bottle 20 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! NO BID #W 
Cyanokit 5 G Hydroxocobalamin 7 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE I NO BID #W 

_j.Dextrose 50% 25om, 50ml Lifeshield t50 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE I NO BID #VI 
SOma Carou"ect 300 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! NO BID #VA 

241 

~ 243 

)opamine, DSW 

=urosemide 
31ucagen 
31utose 15 
lpratropium Bromide 0.025% 
abetalol 
~ 
~agnesium Sulfate 
letoprolol 
laloxone 

Ointment2% 
Tablets 

244 Prop<>lol 
245 Quelicin 
246 Rocuron 
247 Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% 
248 Solu-Medrol 
~ 1e~butaline 

257 0. B. Kits, Latex Free 
258 Protective Go'lfll_ 

[260 Protective Shoe Cov~rs 
Prot99!l~e Sleeves 

IQWck Care Hand Sanitizer 
IQWck Care Holder 
Safe! Glasses 

c ...... c-... ; .......... 

1econium Aspirator 
lasogastric Tube 

be 

fe-T-Vac Suction Catheter 
fe-T-Vac Suction Catheter 
fa-T-Vac Suction Catheter 
fe-T-Vac Suction Catheter 
ction Canister 

Contract Management 
Prepared by Dawn Krass 

400ma, 250m I 28 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $11.25 1 $ 

~ tml Amoule 300 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $2.96 1 $ 
Lifeshield 400 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE I EACH $7.32 1 $ 
40mg, 4ml Vial 200 NO BID #VALUE! #VALUE! EACH $1.00 1 $ 

~ 
~ 
2.5m1Vi( 

)Qmg, 20ml Vial 
IOma. Sml Lifeshield 

lgm,2m 
img,Sm 
~mg, 2ml Lifeshi~_!d_ 
IOgm 
1.4mg tablets 

ng, 2ml iSecure 
)mg/ml, 50ml Vial 
)Qmg, tOml Vial 
lmglml, 1Om I Vial 
lml Lifeshield 

1 25mg, 2ml V1al 
1 mg, 1 ml Vial 

PiN 921 

1 oz 
1 oz 

!Meets ANSI Z8< 

Ounce 

lFR 

FA 

118 FA 
112( 

14 
2s 

50 
14-
10 

!Ill! 
10 
10 

20 
2o 

20 
2o 

20 
20 
20 
60 

NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 
NO BID 

NO BID 
)BID 
)BID 
)BID 
)BID 
)BID 
)BID 
)BID 
)BID 
>BID 

#VALUE! 
#VALUE I 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

#VI 
iiVi 
iiVi 
iiVi 

UE 

EACH 

LBOTTLE 

·us 

UEi""IBc 
iJE!1Bi: 
UEI lEACH 
UEI CASE 

#VALUE, 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VAL 
#VALl 

#VALl 
#VALl 
#VALl 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

leASE 
:ASE 

~ = !EACH 

!EACH 

$18.75 
NO BID 

$29.59 
lNOBID l 
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1 

25 

160 

50 
10 
1 

50 

150 

10 

IV~ 
IVA 
!VALUE! 
!VALUE! 
!VALUE! 
!VALUE! 

$ 1 8.7500 $ 1 ,500.0000 
#VALUE! #VALUE! 

$ 1.1836 $ 47.3440 
_l #VALUE! l #VALUE! 

l$ 

$ 
$ 
$ 

IS 

#VALUE! 

0.0408 $ 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 
#VALUE! 

0.0940 $ 
1.5390 $ 
6.1000 $ 
0.3300 $ 

$ 
$ 

#V 

#VAl 
#VAl 
#VAl 
#VAl 

43.092olEACH 
85.400Q_J,EACH 

8633 CASE 
736 BOX 

#VALUEI I #VAL IE! ICASE 
#VALUE! I #VAL IE! 

f$ t.tooo I$ 0000 lEACH 

I $ 0.8800 I $ 8.8000 lEACH 
I $ 3.9700 I $ 39.7ooo]t,<IW 

li\iAiiiET" #VALUE! 
#VALUE! #VALUE! lEACH 

liiiALOET #VALUE! 1S:ACH 
#VALUE! #VALUE! 
#VALUE' I #VALUE! 
#VALUE! I #VALUE! 
#VALUE! I #VALUE! 

I $ 3.o9oo I $ t 85.4ilo()JQ.CFl 

Bids Opened 9/26113 

NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 
NO BID #VA 

IVA 

$15.74! 150 I$ 
'.56 100 $ 

191 $ 1.4691 ICA 
$ 13.3168 

!.871 12 I$ I$ 178. 
INO BID I I #VA #VAl 

~tOOOIEA 

).31 
3.93 

INOBID 
_g. 

$2. 
!NOBIC 
!NOBIC 
!NOBIC 
!NOBIC 

$~. 

IFf. 
I$ -39: 

#VALUE! 
IL 2.t6oo 
f$ 2.1600 $ 

#VALUE I #VAL 
_11\/Ab_l)_EI I #VAL 

#VALUE! -I #VAL 
#VALUE! I #VAL 

T$ 3.otoo Is 180. 

\CH 
lEACH 
lEACH 
lEACH 
lEACH 

JOO lEACH 

$13.791 300 
"""$7D.8o 

$53.46 
INoChara 

$3. 

IIi 
$0.: 

$6. 
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EXHIBIT "B" 

ATTACHMENT "A" -TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS 

1. The successful bidder shall extend these prices to any other county, or any 
agency within Nassau County, upon request of the using agency. 

2. When there is a specific item description and I or specific brand requested 
no substitutes will be accepted. 

3. Attached is the list of required items for agencies involved. 

4. The bidders shall make all products available for review and approval 
upon request prior to acceptance of the bid or products. 

5. Any backordered item shall be fulfilled within 14 calendar days from the 
date of the back-order; otherwise the backordered items will be canceled 
and procured from other sources. 

6. Nassau County reserves the right to award the bid per item or as a group. 

7. Bid prices shall be binding, with the county reserving the right to buy 
additional items for a period of two years. 

8. No Latex containing product will be accepted without specific written 
agreement. 

9. Unless otherwise specified, all equipment bid shall be engineered to avoid 
needle sticks or self sheathing. This includes all needles, IV Catheters, 
Scalpels. 

10. All pre-filled medication shall be compliant with the Baxter Interlink 
administration system. 

11. Any item(s) marked with"*" requires a sample be submitted for review. 

12. Delivery of all items should be expected within 5 work days from receipt 
of order by the vendor. Any item(s) requiring longer than 5 days shall be 
communicated in written format to Tactical Support; Nassau County Fire 
Rescue. 

13. All bid information shall be contained on the bid price sheet provided. 
Any explanation shall be made on separate paper with the item specified. 

14. There is no requirement to bid on all items, nor is there minimum number 
of items required to be bid upon. 

15. All pharmaceuticals will be awarded as a group bid. This will include 
lines 216-249. 


